

October 2016 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22150051	NO BID	\$1,800.00	\$0.00
2	C22160118	Andrew Goldfine as AG Real Estate	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00
3	C22160107	John Goldfine	\$11,182.41	\$11,182.41
4	C22160117	Scott Thul and Carol Thul	\$5,500.00	\$14,000.00
5	C22160146	Veit International, LLC	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00
6	C22160147	Veit International, LLC	\$12,500.00	\$12,500.00
7	C22160108	Craig S Tollefson, Sr	\$7,162.94	\$7,162.94
8	C22160148	NO BID	\$24,513.11	\$0.00
9	C22160115	NO BID	\$2,000.00	\$0.00
10	C22110118	NO BID	\$4,250.00	\$0.00
11	C22160110	PULLED	\$16,700.00	\$0.00
12	C22160111	PULLED	\$9,200.00	\$0.00
13	C22160109	Derek Medved	\$8,800.00	\$8,800.00
14	C22150060	NO BID	\$1,000.00	\$0.00
15	C22150062	NO BID	\$600.00	\$0.00
16	C22160112	NO BID	\$18,593.69	\$0.00
17	C22160114	NO BID	\$3,000.00	\$0.00
18	C22160113	Shawn Day	\$22,500.00	\$30,000.00
19	C22160151	Mark Pascuzzi and Diane Pascuzzi	\$6,200.00	\$6,200.00
20	C22160152	NO BID	\$23,100.00	\$0.00
21	C22160120	NO BID	\$29,900.00	\$0.00
22	C22160158	Gino Scipioni	\$13,200.00	\$13,200.00
23	C22160155	NO BID	\$22,900.00	\$0.00
24	C22160153	NO BID	\$17,600.00	\$0.00
25	C22160154	NO BID	\$38,300.00	\$0.00
26	C22160101	NO BID	\$4,700.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
27	C22150063	PULLED	\$430.00	\$0.00
28	C22160103	James A Eisner	\$3,000.00	\$6,000.00
29	C22150170	NO BID	\$26,700.00	\$0.00
30	C22160102	NO BID	\$25,000.00	\$0.00
31	C22160105	Jimmie Jay James and Sherri James	\$10,400.00	\$10,400.00
32	C22160106	PULLED	\$15,500.00	\$0.00
33	C22150070	Brian Gornick	\$400.00	\$400.00
34	C22150071	PULLED	\$400.00	\$0.00
35	C22150073	PULLED	\$400.00	\$0.00
36	C22160104	Robert L. Horn, Dianne M. Horn, Robert J. Horn, Steve	\$24,000.00	\$24,000.00
37	C22160123	NO BID	\$55,000.00	\$0.00
38	C22160124	NO BID	\$53,000.00	\$0.00
39	C22160125	NO BID	\$53,000.00	\$0.00
40	C22160126	NO BID	\$58,000.00	\$0.00
41	C22160127	NO BID	\$52,000.00	\$0.00
42	C22160128	NO BID	\$54,500.00	\$0.00
43	C22160129	NO BID	\$56,500.00	\$0.00
44	C22160130	NO BID	\$54,500.00	\$0.00
45	C22160131	Dennis M. Sapp and Mary M. Maki-Sapp	\$63,000.00	\$63,000.00
46	C22160132	NO BID	\$42,000.00	\$0.00
47	C22160133	NO BID	\$51,600.00	\$0.00
48	C22160134	NO BID	\$41,000.00	\$0.00
49	C22160135	NO BID	\$48,500.00	\$0.00
50	C22160136	NO BID	\$53,000.00	\$0.00
51	C22160137	NO BID	\$130,000.00	\$0.00
52	C22160138	NO BID	\$126,000.00	\$0.00
53	C22160139	NO BID	\$140,000.00	\$0.00
54	C22160140	NO BID	\$121,000.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
55	C22160141	NO BID	\$77,000.00	\$0.00
56	C22160144	NO BID	\$62,000.00	\$0.00
Total Tracts		56	Total Value \$1,850,032.15	
Pulled Tracts		6	Pulled Tracts Value \$0.00	
Net Available Tracts		50	Net Total Value \$1,850,032.15	\$253,845.35
Total Tracts Sold		15		
Percent of Available Tracts Sold		30.00%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	13.72%